
City of Rochester, NH

Plow & Wing Blades  & Parts Bid # 14-18

09/12/13 2:30 PM

Item# Descrioption H.P. Fairfield Donovan Viking Cives Jordan Atlantic Broom Winter Equipment
1 Kenna Metal Carbide 12” Hwy Punch 

6”x ¾” $59.00 No Bid $50.00 $54.00 $52.00 $62.00
2 Cutting edge 926 loader 47”X10”X1”

$341.50 No Bid $625.00 $175.39 $244.88 No Bid
3 Volvo grader-moldboard 84”X8”X5/8”

$85.00 No Bid $128.75 $106.60 $128.00 No Bid
4 9’ Fisher plow blade     108”X6”X5/8”

$74.00 $146.15 $77.85 $83.36 $82.94 $92.90
5 8’ Fisher plow blade       96”X6”X5/8”

$67.00 $126.70 $69.20 $74.10 $73.72 $82.56
6 Daewoo loader cutting Edge25 

¾”X16”1 ¼” $283.00 No Bid $637.50 $297.62 No Bid No Bid
7 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 

120”X6”X5/8” $82.50 $144.90 $86.50 $92.61 $92.16 $103.20
8 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 

132”X6”X5/8” $90.50 $158.76 $95.15 $101.86 $101.37 $113.52
9 Grader plow cover blade

12" hwy punch 84"x8:x5/8"
$85.00 No Bid $86.52 $115.12 $128.00 $90.21

10 Trackless Snow blower cutting edge 
50”X6”X1/2” $45.00 No Bid $56.25 $51.09 $39.95 No Bid

11 Bombardier cutting edge 60”X6”X5/8”

$35.00 No Bid $56.25 $91.59 $55.00 No Bid
12 Trackless plow blade  60”X6”X5/8”

$35.00 No Bid $56.25 $52.29 $55.00 No Bid
13 Snow blower cutting edge 

96”X8”X5/8” $90.00 No Bid $98.88 $99.68 $97.92 No Bid



14 938H Cat Loader-1”x12”x46 ½”  1” 
bolt hole Middle Section (2 each), 
1”x6”12 ½” 1” bolt hole end piece (2 
each) $525.00 No Bid $625.00 $492.36 $351.55 No Bid

15 1420 E Cat Backhoe ¾”x8”x47” 5/8” 
bolt hole (2 each) $116.50 No Bid $362.50 $109.76 $166.32 No Bid

16 Bobcat ¾”x8”x60” ½” Bolt hole 

No Bid No Bid $226.90 $167.30 $206.00 No Bid
17 Volvo snow bucket  ¾”8”78” 5/8” Bolt 

hole No bid No Bid $295.00 $219.81 $332.64 No Bid
18 ½” x 2” Plow bolts

$0.72 No Bid No Bid $0.52 $1.50 No Bid
19 ½” x 2 ½” Flat head blade bolt

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.61 $1.75 No Bid
20 5/8” x 2 ½” Plow bolt

$1.15 $1.06 No Bid $0.84 $1.85 $0.50
21 5/8” x 3” Plow bolt

$1.25 No Bid No Bid $0.92 $1.95 $0.60
22 5/8” x 3 ½” Plow bolt

$1.50 $1.42 No Bid $0.99 $2.05 $0.70
23 5/8” x 4” Plow bolt

$1.50 No Bid No Bid $1.08 $2.15 $0.79
24 5/8” x 4 ½” Plow Bolt

$1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 $0.91
25 5’8” x 2” Flat head blade bolt

$0.60 No Bid No Bid $0.80 $1.50 No Bid
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Plow & Wing Blades  & Parts Bid # 14-18
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Item# Descrioption H.P. Fairfield Donovan Viking Cives Jordan Atlantic Broom Winter Equipment
1 Kenna Metal Carbide 12” Hwy Punch 

6”x ¾” $59.00 No Bid $50.00 $54.00 $52.00 $62.00
2 Cutting edge 926 loader 47”X10”X1”

$341.50 No Bid $625.00 $175.39 $244.88 No Bid
3 Volvo grader-moldboard 84”X8”X5/8”

$85.00 No Bid $128.75 $106.60 $128.00 No Bid
4 9’ Fisher plow blade     108”X6”X5/8”

$74.00 $146.15 $77.85 $83.36 $82.94 $92.90
5 8’ Fisher plow blade       96”X6”X5/8”

$67.00 $126.70 $69.20 $74.10 $73.72 $82.56
6 Daewoo loader cutting Edge25 

¾”X16”1 ¼” $283.00 No Bid $637.50 $297.62 No Bid No Bid
7 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 

120”X6”X5/8” $82.50 $144.90 $86.50 $92.61 $92.16 $103.20
8 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 

132”X6”X5/8” $90.50 $158.76 $95.15 $101.86 $101.37 $113.52
9 Grader plow cover blade

12" hwy punch 84"x8:x5/8"
$85.00 No Bid $86.52 $115.12 $128.00 $90.21



10 Trackless Snow blower cutting edge 
50”X6”X1/2” $45.00 No Bid $56.25 $51.09 $39.95 No Bid

11 Bombardier cutting edge 60”X6”X5/8”

$35.00 No Bid $56.25 $91.59 $55.00 No Bid
12 Trackless plow blade  60”X6”X5/8”

$35.00 No Bid $56.25 $52.29 $55.00 No Bid
13 Snow blower cutting edge 

96”X8”X5/8” $90.00 No Bid $98.88 $99.68 $97.92 No Bid
14 938H Cat Loader-1”x12”x46 ½”  1” 

bolt hole Middle Section (2 each), 
1”x6”12 ½” 1” bolt hole end piece (2 
each) $525.00 No Bid $625.00 $492.36 $351.55 No Bid

15 1420 E Cat Backhoe ¾”x8”x47” 5/8” 
bolt hole (2 each) $116.50 No Bid $362.50 $109.76 $166.32 No Bid

16 Bobcat ¾”x8”x60” ½” Bolt hole 

No Bid No Bid $226.90 $167.30 $206.00 No Bid
17 Volvo snow bucket  ¾”8”78” 5/8” Bolt 

hole No bid No Bid $295.00 $219.81 $332.64 No Bid
18 ½” x 2” Plow bolts

$0.72 No Bid No Bid $0.52 $1.50 No Bid
19 ½” x 2 ½” Flat head blade bolt

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.61 $1.75 No Bid
20 5/8” x 2 ½” Plow bolt

$1.15 $1.06 No Bid $0.84 $1.85 $0.50
21 5/8” x 3” Plow bolt

$1.25 No Bid No Bid $0.92 $1.95 $0.60
22 5/8” x 3 ½” Plow bolt

$1.50 $1.42 No Bid $0.99 $2.05 $0.70



23 5/8” x 4” Plow bolt

$1.50 No Bid No Bid $1.08 $2.15 $0.79
24 5/8” x 4 ½” Plow Bolt

$1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 $0.91
25 5’8” x 2” Flat head blade bolt

$0.60 No Bid No Bid $0.80 $1.50 No Bid


	Sheet1
	Sheet2

