City of Rochester, NH

Water & Sewer Inventory Bid # 07-39

April 12, 2007 2:30 PM

JAF
Industries, Public Works |EJ Prescott,
Inc. Stiles Supply Inc.
ITEM # DISCRIPTION
1|ADAP LEAD COMP 5/8"X3/4"
No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.62
2|ADAP LEAD COMP MSX3/4”
No Bid No Bid No Bid 37.61
3|ADAP LEAD COM RHX3/4”
No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.85
4|8 TPO PIPE DUCTILE 52 CL
No Bid No Bid 15.90 16.14
5/8 TPO PIPE DUCTILE 52 DC/DSC
No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.14
6/10 TPO PIPE DUCTILE 52 DC/DSC
No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.68
7112 TPO PIPE DUCTILE 52 CL
No Bid No Bid 26.27 26.68
8[20 TPO PIPE DUCTILE 52 CL
No Bid No Bid 51.42 47.96
9|6 TPO GASKET
No Bid No Bid 67.18 2.66
10|8 TPO GASKET
No Bid No Bid 93.59 431
11{10 TPO GASKET
No Bid No Bid 135.12 5.82
12(12 TPO GASKET
No Bid No Bid 183.18 6.59
13|20 TPO GASKET
No Bid No Bid 545.53 19.73
14|1 QUART LUBE
No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.57




15

6 PE BACKING RING STEEL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.22
16|6 PE BACKING RING DI

No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.14
17|6 CLEAN-OUT ADAPT W/PLUG SWR

No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.80
18|6 CLEAN-OUT HUB ADAPT L/PLG SWR

No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.10
19|6X12 MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 74.44
20(20X15 MJ DI CB SOLID SLEEVE 350

No Bid No Bid No Bid 814.94
21(6 MJ SOLID CAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.04
22(8X6 MJ DI HYD TEE CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 212.23
23(8 MJ DI 90 BEND CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 122.76
24(8X6 MJ DI RDUCER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.05
25(8X12 MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 97.95
26(8 MJ DI SOLID CAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.67
27(10X6 MJ DI TEE CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 197.86
28(10 FOSTER MJ ADAPTOR W/ACC

No Bid No Bid 199.94 169.45
29(10X12 MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 117.54
30(12 MJ DI TEE CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 340.21
31(12X8 MJ DI TEE CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 282.10
32(12X6 MJ TEE CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 254.67
33(12 MJ DI 45 BEND CL

No Bid No Bid 200.47




34

12 MJ DI 22 2 BEND CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 201.12
35(12X8 MJ DI REDUCER CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 138.44
36(12 FOSTER MJ ADAPTOR W/ACC

No Bid No Bid 219.94 193.87
37(12X12 MJ DI SOLID SLEEVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 158.68
38(12 MJ SOLID CAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 90.77
39(12 MJ DI WYE CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 816.25
40(16 MJ DI CB SOLID CAP 350

No Bid No Bid No Bid 254.08
41|% BRASS 90 ELBOW

No Bid No Bid 3.06 3.80
42|% BRASS THRD CPLG

No Bid No Bid 2.48 3.08
43|% BRASS PLUG

No Bid No Bid 1.79 3.05
44|1X4 2 BRASS NIPPLE

No Bid No Bid 6.24 10.81
45|1X5 BRASS NIPPLE

No Bid No Bid 7.70 11.95
46|1X6 BRASS NIPPLE

No Bid No Bid 9.19 14.27
47|1 BRASS PLUG

No Bid No Bid 2.36 5.19
48|1X3/4 BRASS RED CPLG

No Bid No Bid 4.95 6.15
49|1 ¥4 BRASS TEE

No Bid No Bid 9.38 11.65
50(1 ¥4 BRASS THRD CPLG

No Bid No Bid 5.88 7.30
51(1 ¥4 BRASS PLUG

No Bid No Bid 3.52 9.34
52(1 1/4X1 BRASS BUSH

No Bid No Bid 4.23 5.24




53

6 MJ DI RS VALVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 476.80
54|8 MJ DI RS VALVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 758.20
55|8 MJ DI RS TAP VALVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 986.85
56/10X8 SS TAP SLEEVE 1105-1145

No Bid No Bid No Bid 672.42
57|10X6 SS TAP SLEEVE 1105-1145

No Bid No Bid No Bid 553.92
58|12 MJ DI RS VALVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,476.00
59|12 MJ DI RS TAP VALVE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,247.40
60|20X12 SS TAP SLEEVE 2140-2180

No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,306.73
61|48IN HYDRANT FLAG 3/8 GALV

No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.11
62|4’ GALV SPRING FLAG W/REFL STRIPS

No Bid No Bid No Bid 18.10
63|6W HYD TOP EXT

No Bid No Bid No Bid 280.60
64|W HYD COTTER PIN 1/4X1 % 8

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.45
65|5 ¥4 HYD K81A 5-6 OL 6MJ NST7

No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,132.97
66|5 ¥4 HYD K81A 5-6 OR 6MJINST

No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,132.97
67|14 1/2X12 GUARDIAN HYD EXT K81A

No Bid No Bid No Bid 370.11
68|5 ¥4 K81 SAFETY REPAIR KIT

No Bid No Bid No Bid 142.35
69|5 ¥4 EDDY REPAIR KIT WD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 183.43
70|5 B84 HYD 5-6 OR 6MJNSTB41-3WAY

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,760.00
71|5 B84 HYD 5-6 OR 6MJNSTB41-3WAY

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,760.00




72

5 B84 HYD 6-0 OR 6MJINSTB41-3WAY

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,798.00
73|5 ¥4 B62 HYD REPAIR KIT 1986

No Bid No Bid 114.22 202.41
74/B84 HOUSING COVER OR-OL 9

No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.31
75|2 %2 HOSE NOZZLE NST 84-20-3

No Bid No Bid No Bid 80.73
76|HOSE NOZZLE 0-RING 84-2—4

No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.95
77/1B84 HOSE CAPS 21

No Bid No Bid No Bid 67.86
78/B84 HOSE GASKET 22

No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.68
79|16 ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.67
80(6 MJ GASKET KIT 3/4X4 N&B

No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.30
81(6 MJ DI GRIP RING ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.94
82(8 ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.81
83(8 MJ DI GRIP RING ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 56.94
84(10 ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 70.48
85(12 MJ DI GRIP RING ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 111.45
86(12 ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 95.55
87(16 ROMAGRIP ACCESSORY PACK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 169.90
88(20 MEGALUG ACCESSORY PACK DI

No Bid No Bid No Bid 334.91
89(VALVE BOX COVER WATER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.95
90(26/36 TF VALVE BOX W/CVR 664A

No Bid No Bid No Bid 142.37




91

26 VALVE BOX TOP TF

No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.97
92(36 VALVE BOX BASE BELL
No Bid No Bid No Bid 67.46
93(5 1/2X18 RITE RISE VB RISER
No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.65
94(5 1/4X6 BOX TOP EXT RD L/C
No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.05
95(5 1/4X12 BOX TOP EXT RD L/C
No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.06
96(EZ RISER COVER WATER
No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.56
97(6 EZ RISE SLIDE RISER
No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.96
98(12 EZ RISE SLIDE RISER
No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.61
99(5 1/4X1 VB RISER L/C STR
No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.67
1005 1/4X2 VB RISER L/C STR
No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.67
1015 1/4X3 FIXED TOP EXT L/C
No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.34
102|5 1/4X3 VB RISER L/C STR
No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.34
103|1 SERVICE BOX PLUG COVER ROPE
No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.04
104({1 SERVICE BOX PLUG REPAIR COVER
No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.97
105(4-5 SERVICE BOX L/C
No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.16
106(5-6 SERVICE BOX L/C
No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.24
107(9/16X30 SERVICE BOX ROD-
No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.96
108(1/2X36 SERVICE BOX ROD STAINLESS
No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.22
109(9/16X36 SERVICE BOX ROD
No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.16




110|5/8X30 SERVICE BOX ROD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.16
111{SERVICE BOX FOOT PIECE HEAVY

No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.28
112|1/6 SERVICE BOX EXT W/SCREW LC

No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.14
113|1X12 SERVICE BOX EXT W/SCREW LC

No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.74
114|1X18 SERVICE BOX EXT W/SCREW LC

No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.21
115|3/4X60 K COPPER TUBE

No Bid 416.40 No Bid 5.30
116|3/4X100 K COPPER TUBE

No Bid 632.00 No Bid 5.30
117{1X60 K COPPER TUBE

No Bid 540.00 No Bid 6.93
118{1X100 K COPPER TUBE

No Bid 900.00 No Bid 6.93
119|2X40 K COPPER TUBE

No Bid 622.00 No Bid 18.59
120|% BALL CURB QUICK

No Bid 31.62 No Bid 50.59
121{% BALL CORP CCXQUICK

No Bid 23.10 No Bid 24.58
122{% CORP IPXCPPJ

No Bid 23.10 No Bid 25.59
123|% BALL CURB QUICK

No Bid 31.62 No Bid 50.59
124{% BALL CURB FIPXQUICK

No Bid 27.77 No Bid 44.42
125(% BALL CURB IP

No Bid 24.58 No Bid 39.31
126(3%: CPLG QUICK

No Bid 8.72 No Bid 14.26
127{% CPLG CPPJXIPPJ

No Bid 9.65 No Bid 15.78
128|334 CPLG QUICKXIPPJ

No Bid 9.65 No Bid 15.78




129

¥ CPLG QUICKXFIP

No Bid 7.52 No Bid 12.31
130|%4 CPLG IPPJXFEIP

No Bid 7.52 No Bid 14.03
131(% CPLG QUICKXIP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.71
132|% ADAPTER CPLG 6130CC

No Bid 8.72 No Bid 14.59
133|1 BALL CORP CCXQUICK

No Bid 30.38 No Bid 48.60
134({1 BALL CURB QUICK

No Bid 47.54 No Bid 76.06
135|1 BALL CURB FIPXQUICK

No Bid 42.64 No Bid 68.20
136|1 BALL CURB IP

No Bid 38.19 No Bid 61.10
137|1 ADAPTER CPLG 6130CC

No Bid 9.97 No Bid 20.59
138|1 CPLG IPPJXFEIP

No Bid 13.01 No Bid 20.29
139|1 CPLG CPPJXMIP

No Bid 8.49 No Bid 13.88
140({1 CPLG QUICKXMIP

No Bid 8.49 No Bid 13.88
141|1 CPLG IPPJIXMIP

No Bid 13.19 No Bid 21.58
142|1 CPLG QUICKXIPPJ

No Bid 12.95 No Bid 21.19
143|1 ¥ CPLG QUICKXFEIP

No Bid 13.94 No Bid 25.98
144(1 ¥ CPLG QUICK X MIP

No Bid 14.82 No Bid 22.57
145|1 ¥ CPLG QUICK

No Bid 15.75 No Bid 23.98
146|2 BALL CORP CCXQUICK

No Bid 102.95 No Bid 164.71
147(2 BALL CURB QUICK

No Bid 146.22 No Bid 233.94




148

2 BALL CURB QUICKXFIP

No Bid 118.05 No Bid 188.88
149|2 BALL CRUB FEIP

No Bid 104.56 No Bid 168.36
150(2 CPLG QUICK

No Bid 41.18 No Bid 67.40
151|5/8 SR ECR METER 100F W/PAD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 118.95
152|5/8X3/4 SR ECR METER 100F W/PAD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 118.95
153|REMOTE METER WIRE 3-22GA

No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.14
154|5/8 SR ECR REGISTER 1000G

No Bid No Bid No Bid 65.24
155|5/8 METER GASKET RUBBER 3/40D

No Bid 0.09 No Bid 0.23
156|% SR ECR METER 100F W/PAD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 152.68
157|1 SR ECR METER 100F W/PAD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 193.41
158|1 SR ECR METER 100F W/PAD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 193.41
159(% METER GASKET RUBBER 10D

No Bid 0.12 No Bid 0.27
160|1 METER GASKET RUBBER 1 1/40D

No Bid 0.15 No Bid 0.23
161|1 ¥> SR ECR MTR 100F W/BRFL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 473.89
162|2 SR ECR METER 1000F W/PD&BFL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 650.03
163|2 SR ECR CONVERSION KIT 100F

No Bid No Bid No Bid 64.47
164|MXU 510R NP SINGLE PORT TC W/ITR

No Bid No Bid No Bid 110.50
165|MXU RADIO READ UNIT 505C DUAL PT

No Bid No Bid No Bid 136.50
166|MXU 510 SINGLE PORT NOW PIT

No Bid No Bid No Bid 107.91




167(2 COMP METER ECR 1—F W/BRLG

No Bid No Bid No Bid 786.37
168(2 TURBO ECR REM MTR 100F W/BRFL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 786.37
169(4-6 COM REGISTER ECR 1000F

No Bid No Bid No Bid 167.26
170{6 COMPOUND PISTON CHAMBER COMP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 389.64
171{6 COMPOUND MAIN FLG GSK ILL #72

No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.90
172|3% METER PREV 3/4FEIP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 84.22
173|%2 CP SETTER PACK JOINT 1-SK

No Bid 6.31 No Bid 9.91
174(% CP SETTER PACK JOINT 1-3K

No Bid 5.73 No Bid 8.99
175(4/8X3/4 #2 KORNERHORN L/C

No Bid 23.46 No Bid 36.81
176|5/8-5/8X3/4 METER ADAPT RINGM

No Bid 6.35 No Bid 3.25
177(% METER CONN 3% MIP

No Bid 4.65 No Bid 5.21
178(3% 90 METER CONN 34 MIP

No Bid 6.83 No Bid 9.02
179(3/4X1 VALVE HANDLE STR

No Bid 2.99 No Bid 4.33
180{1 METER CONN 1 MIP

No Bid 7.30 No Bid 8.03
181(3/4X6 LEAK CLAMP 105

No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.39
182(3/4X5 2 BOLT CPLG 105

No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.20
183|3/4X5 BOLT CPLG 105

No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.20
184(1X3 LEAK CLAMP 132

No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.62
185|1 1/4X5 BOLT CPLG 166

No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.91




186

2X8 SS1 REP CLAMP 235263

No Bid 26.15 No Bid 75.95
187|2X6 SS1 REP CLAMP 235263

No Bid 26.15 No Bid 75.94
188(2X12 SS1 REP CLAMP 684724

No Bid 39.43 No Bid 126.36
189|6X8 SS1 REP CLAMP 684724

No Bid 36.49 No Bid 111.84
190(6X12 SS1 TAP CLAMP 1CC 684724

No Bid 56.56 No Bid 223.39
191|8X8 SS1 REP CLAMP 900040

No Bid 41.49 No Bid 131.05
192(8X8 SS1 TAP CLAMP 3/4CC 900940

No Bid 46.73 No Bid 175.85
193|8X8 FS1 TP CLAMP 1CC 899939

No Bid 46.73 No Bid 148.32
194(8 202M SADD;E 2CC 800863

No Bid No Bid No Bid 95.61
195(10X12 SS1 REP CLAMP 11041144

No Bid 81.31 No Bid 274.01
196({10X12 SS3 REP CLAMP 11041224

No Bid No Bid No Bid 504.21
197(10X12 SS2 REP CLAMP 11401220

No Bid No Bid No Bid 435.83
198(10 202N SADDLE 2CC 11101212

No Bid 58.84 No Bid 129.91
199(10 202N SADDLE 2CC 10001110

No Bid No Bid No Bid 130.31
200]|10X8 XR501 DUCT CPLG 1070-1215

No Bid No Bid No Bid 251.23
201|12X10S REP CLAMP 14001440

No Bid No Bid No Bid 225.58
202|12X10D REP CLAMP 13141434

No Bid No Bid No Bid 291.53
203|12X12 SS1 REP CLAMP 12701310

No Bid No Bid No Bid 317.55
204|12X12 SS1 REP CLAMP 13151355

No Bid No Bid No Bid 317.56




205

12X12 SS1 REP CLAMP 1410450

No Bid No Bid No Bid 317.56
206|12X12 SS3 REP CLAMP 13141434

No Bid No Bid No Bid 572.42
207|12X12 SS3 REP CLAMP 13451465

No Bid No Bid No Bid 572.42
208|12X16 SS1 REP CLAMP 12701310

No Bid No Bid No Bid 359.08
209|12X16 SS1 REP CLAMP 13151355

No Bid No Bid No Bid 359.08
210|12X16 SS2 REP CLAMP 13151395

No Bid No Bid No Bid 522.80
211|12X16 SS3 REP CLAMP 13141434

No Bid No Bid No Bid 726.08
212|12X16 SS3 REP CLAMP 13451465

No Bid No Bid No Bid 726.08
213|12 202N SADDLE 2CC 13201438

No Bid 65.01 No Bid 150.26
21412 202N SADDLE 2I1P 12001320

No Bid 65.01 No Bid 150.26
215|12 STYLE 262 HYMAX CPLG 12401366

No Bid 288.00 No Bid 483.12
216|24 BELL CLAMP 25802632

No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,557.28
217|880B FERROMAGNETIC LOCATOR

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,425.45
218|DIGITAL LEAK DETECTOR DLD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,995.00
219|24 PAMREX DI CP F&GRATE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 393.90
220|32 PAMREX DI MH F&C DRAIN

No Bid No Bid No Bid 629.50
221|32 PAMREX DI MH F&C SEWER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 629.50
222|124 REXEL DI CB F&GRATE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 276.90
223|32 PAMREX DI MH F&C SEWER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 629.50




224

24 REXEL DI CP F&GRATE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 276.90
225|4 FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVE

No Bid 3.75 3.66 6.19
226|4 FLEXIBLE CPLG CIl/PVC

No Bid 3.75 3.66 6.19
227|6 FLEXIBLE CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC

No Bid 7.50 8.04 13.22
228|6 FLEXIBLE CPLG CIl/PVC

No Bid 7.50 7.83 13.22
229|8 FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC

No Bid 11.65 12.06 20.34
230|10 FLEXIBLE CPLG CI/PVC

No Bid 16.24 17.19 28.28
231|12 FLEXIBLE CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC

No Bid 19.00 20.07 32.99
232|12 FLEXIBLE CPLG CI/PVC

No Bid 19.00 20.07 32.99
233|12 FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC

No Bid 19.00 20.07 32.99
234|15 FLEXIBLE CPLG CLAY-CI/PVC

No Bid 30.00 34.42 56.59
235|6-12X4 FLEX SWR TEESADDLE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 44,56
236|5/16-1 1/8 RATCH-CUT MODEL 3790

No Bid No Bid No Bid 46.75
237|4 T HANDLE SB WRENCH PENT PW4

No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.64
238|5T HANDLE SB WRENCH RODEND RES

No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.99
239|124 REXEL DI CP F&GRATE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 276.90
240|4 FLEXIBLE CPLG CIl/PVC

No Bid 3.75 No Bid 6.19
241|6 FLEXIBLE No Bid

E CPLG AC/DI-CI/PVC 7.50 No Bid 13.22

242|6 FLEXIBLE CPLG CIl/PVC

No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.22




243|10 FLEXIBLE CPLG CI/PVC

No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.28
24416-12X4 FLEX SWR TEE SADDLE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 44,56
245|5/16-1 1/8 RATCH-CUT MODEL 3790

No Bid No Bid No Bid 46.75
24616 ADJ HANDLE HYD WRENCH

No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.26
247|B-1-1 1 CC TAP & DRILL 680540

No Bid No Bid No Bid 223.98
248(B-TOO QUIK REL SCR PLUG 3/4FC

No Bid No Bid No Bid 81.48
249|B-1 CHAIN TIGHTENING STUD

No Bid No Bid No Bid 38.39
250|B-1 CHAIN HOLDER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.64
251|% CC TAP & DRILL B-B100

No Bid No Bid No Bid 214.78
252|30X4 MH FRAM LA324-5

No Bid No Bid No Bid 133.36
253|30 MH COVER DRAIN L32CC

No Bid No Bid No Bid 218.70
254|130 CB GRATE RD L32GA

No Bid No Bid No Bid 210.89
255|CASCADE CB FRAM LK450

No Bid No Bid No Bid 213.09
256|CASCADE CB GRATE L2422G1

No Bid No Bid No Bid 237.26
257|KENT SEAL FOR CONCRETE MH

No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.21
258|18X20 CMP PLAIN 16GA

No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.97
259|18 CMP BAND PLAIN 16GA

No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.45
260|36X20 CMP PLAIN 14GA

No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.26
261|4 FILTER SOCK PER FT

No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.34




262|4X250 PE PIPE HWY PERF W/SOCK

No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.92
263|12 SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.64
264|12 SURE-LOK PE PIPE PER S-T

No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.64
265|15 SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.50
266|15 SURE-LOK PE PIPE PERF S-T

No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.50
267|18 SURE-LOK PE PIPESILT-TITE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.13
268|18 SURE-LOK PE PIPE PERF S-T

No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.13
269|24 SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.35
270|36 SURE-LOK PE PIPE SILT-TITE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.55
271(12 PE HIQ END SECTION

No Bid No Bid No Bid 125.42
272(4 HIQ SNAP CPLG

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.23
273(12X4 HIQ SADDLE TEE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.51
274(12X4 HIQ SADDLE TEE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 43.51
275(15 HANCOR HIQ SPLIT COUPLER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.24
276(15 PE HIQ END SECTION

No Bid No Bid No Bid 125.42
277|15X4 HANCOR SADDLE TEE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.23
27818 HANCOR HIQ SPLIT COUPLER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.57
279(18 PE HIQ END SECTION

No Bid No Bid No Bid 168.48
280|LIT'L GULP HYDRANT PUMP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 156.00




281

3X30 RUBBER SUC HOSE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 218.97
282|3 STRAINER DIAPH

No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.93
283|SAW BLADE DUCTILE 1 IN-14

No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.88
284|14X1 EJP BLADE GP GPS14125

No Bid No Bid No Bid 184.13
285|PRESCOTT PLUG HYDRAULIC CEMENT

No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.25
286|20X12 SS INSTALL & TAP

No Bid No Bid No Bid 950.00
287|FIELD TEST METER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 500.00
288|ORANGE FLAG TAPE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.02
289|FIELD TESTER METER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 500.00
290|S75 STRAW BLANKET

No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.55
2916111 WIRE STAPLE 1000/CTN

No Bid No Bid No Bid 54.86
291|ADAP LEAD FLARE 5/8"X3/4"RH

No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.61
293|ADAP LEAD COMP 5/8"X3/4” RH

No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.61
294|3/8X50" COIL 7X19 GALV CABLE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 90.09
295|3/8X100’ COIL 7X19 GALV CABLE

No Bid No Bid No Bid 180.18
296|4 FLG FILLER PIECE/PER INCH

No Bid No Bid No Bid 156.00
297|6 TPO PIPE DUCTILE 52 CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.72
298|8 TPO PIPE DUCTILE 52CL

No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.14
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