City of Rochester

Chemicals
07-59 Chemicals
2:30 PM

Solvay Borden & Carus

Fluorides |Monson |Remington [Univar [Holland |Basic [Phosphates |Harcros |[Shannon |Coyne [General
Aluminum Sulfate-48% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |0.912 No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |0.83687
Sodium Hydroxide-25% No Bid No Bid ]0.6189 0.6642 [No Bid [0.709 |No Bid 0.75324 [No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Sodium Aluminate-38% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |2.50 No Bid |[No Bid No bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid

0.795

Sodium Hypochlorite-15% No Bid .865 0.6332 0.5503 [No Bid |No Bid |No Bid 0.7380 [No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Hydroflourosilisic Acid 23-25% No Bid 2.977 20.24 No Bid |No Bid [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Sodium Hydrosulfite Conc. 90% No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.50 No Bid [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid 1.1937 |No Bid
Corrosion Inhibitor 3:1 Zinc Orthophospate |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid [No Bid |0.742 No Bid ]0.974 0.9889 |No Bid
Dense Soda Ash No Bid 0.154 0.1506 0.1503 [No Bid |No Bid [No Bid 0.15169 [No Bid No Bid |No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate No Bid 0.309 No Bid No Bid |No Bid [No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid |No Bid
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