
City of Rochester, NH
Sweeper Brooms & Parts
Bid #07-64
2:45 PM

V3000 JOHNSTON Atlantic Broom Howard Fairfield E.W. Sleeper , Inc. ODB
Tube Broom Poly Filament 245.00 250.00 360.00 232.00

12 Piece Snap on Gutter Broom Wire 86.00 85.00 115.20 82.00

Dirt shoes 165.00 135.00 No Bid 103.00

Rubber Elevator Chain 11 Flight No Bid 1,025.00 No Bid 741.00

Squeegee Rubbers No Bid 24.00 No Bid 14.70

Split Sprockets Double Hand Face No Bid 310.00 No Bid 282.37

BOBCAT BROOM

21” Wafer’s Flat 2 each 7.50 7.50 7.20 6.84

21” Wafer’s Convoluted 40 each 7.50 7.50 7.20 7.04
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