
City of Rochester

Plow & Wing Blades & Parts #08-13

10/4/07 2:45 PM

Item # Description of Item Tenco Atlantic Broom Howard Fairfield
1 Kenna Metal Carbide 12” Hwy Punch 6”x ¾”

60.15 50.00 50.00
2 Cutting edge 926 loader 47”X10”X1” NO BID 199.84 NO BID
3 Volvo grader-moldboard 84”X8”X5/8” NO BID 94.00 NO BID
4 Cutting edge    70 ¾”X6”X 3/4” NO BID 69.77 NO BID
5 9’ Fisher plow blade     108”X6”X5/8” 106.92 87.57 99.00
6 8’ Fisher plow blade       96”X6”X5/8” NO BID 77.84 88.00
7 Daewoo loader cutting Edge25 ¾”X16”1 ¼” NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 Cutting edge  69 1/8”X16”X1 ¼” NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 120”X6”X5/8” 118.80 97.30 120.00

10 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 132”X6”X5/8” 130.68 107.03 132.00
11 Grader plow cover blade 12" hwy punch 144"x7"x5/8"

NO BID NO BID 132.00
12 426 bucket cutting edge 90”X87 ½”X3/4” NO BID 308.80 NO BID
13 NO BID 40.00 64.00
14 Bob cat cutting edge  60”X6”X1/2” NO BID 40.00 NO BID
15 Bombardier cutting edge 60”X6”X5/8” NO BID 50.00 NO BID
16 936 loader cutting edge 52 ½”X 12”X1” NO BID 283.75 NO BID
17 Trackless plow blade  60”X6”X5/8” NO BID 50.00 60.00
18 Snow blower cutting edge 96”X8”X5/8” NO BID 103.36 NO BID

Trackless Snow blower cutting edge 50”X6”X1/2”


