City of Rochester
Stone, Gravel & Washed Sand

Bid # 08-38

2:30 PM

Item F.L. Merrill Pike Industries Plourde Sand Gravel |Ossipee Aggregates
1 1/2" Stone $10.00 $10.25 $9.59/Del. $22.20 No Bid

3/4" Stone $10.00 $10.25 $9.59/Del. $22.20 No Bid

3/4" Stone Base $8.75 $7.00 $7.43/Del. $20.04 No Bid

Crushed Stone Fine Grade No Bid $7.00 $13.52/Del. $26.13 No Bid

Rip Rap $12.00 $11.75 No Bid

1 1/2" Crushed Gravel $6.00 $7.00 $8.22/Del $20.83 No Bid

Washed Sand No Bid $8.00 $8.25/Del. $20.86 $7.30

Delivery Charge

$5.40 per ton

$66.00/$3.00 per ton
based on 22 ton triaxle load

$2.25 per ton

Incorrect bid form




Brox

$10.50

$10.50

$7.25

$10.50

$7.00

$10.50

$3.00

Incorrect bid form




