
City of Rochester
Chemicals
08-44 Chemicals
2:30 PM

Basic Chemical Holland Shannon GAC
General
Chemical Univar Monson

Borden &
Reminton Harcross

Aluminum Sulfate-48% No Bid 1.13 No Bid
Bid 
Withdrawn 1.1555 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Hydroxide-25% 1.51 No Bid No Bid
Bid 
Withdrawn No Bid 1.1418 No Bid 1.165 1.233

Sodium Hypochlorite-15% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bid 
Withdrawn No Bid 0.8236 No Bid 0.9148 0.7823

Hydroflourosilisic Acid 23-25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.146 No Bid No Bid
Sodium Hydrosulfite Conc. 90% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Corrosion Inhibitor 3:1 Zinc Orthophospate No Bid No Bid 2.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dense Soda Ash No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2003 0.194 0.2056 0.1976
Sodium Bicarbonate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.274 No Bid No Bid

* GAC has withdrawn there bid


