
Plow & Wing Parts #08-51
City of Rochester, NH

June 12, 2008 3:00 PM

Item # Description Amount Howard Fairfiled Atlantic Broom

Item #1
Kenna Metal Carbide 12" Hwy
Punch 6"x3/4"1 1/2 offest $55.00 $62.00

Item #2 Cutting Edge 926 loader 47"x10"x1" No Bid $258.04
Item #3 Volvo Grader-Moldboard 84"x8"x5/8" $101.00 $121.38
Item #4 Fermec Back Hoe 94 3/4x8"x3/4" No Bid $369.60
Item #5 9' Fisher Plow Blade 108"x6"5/8" $127.00 $112.89
Item #6 8' Fisher Plow Blade 96"x6"x5/8" $130.00 $100.35
Item #7 Daewoo Loader Cutting Edge $1,440.00 No Bid
Item #8 Volvo Loader 71"x8"x3/4" No Bid $277.20
Item #9 Plow cover blade 12" hwy punch 120"x6"5/8" $142.00 $125.44
Item #10 Plow Cover Blade 12" Hwy Punch 132x6"5/8" $156.00 $137.98
Item #11 Grader Plow Cover Blade 12"144x6"x5/8" $170.00 $150.48
Item #12 426 Bucket Cutting Edge 90"x87 1/2x3/4" No Bid $369.60
Item #13 Trackless Snow Blower Cutting Edge 50"x6"x1/2" $62.00 $58.91
Item #14 936 Loader Cutting Edge 52 1/2"x12"x1" No Bid $374.70
Item #15 Trackless Plow Blade 60"x6"5/8" $64.00 $75.26
Item #16 Snow Blower Cutting Edge 96"x8"x5/8" $135.00 $138.72


