UNIFORM & EQUIPMENT BIDS

NEPTUNE GALL'S BEN'S LAWMENS PARRO'S
95 US Rt2
360 Washington Street 2680 Palumbo Drive |20 Main Street 7750 9th Street SW Waterbury, VT
Haverhill, MA 01832 800- Lexington KY 40509 Amesbury MA 01913 Vero Beach, FL 32968 05676 802-
456-1234 800-876-4242 800-255-2367 772-569-8700 244-8401
ARTICLE
1 $34.00 no bid $46.00 no bid no bid
2 $31.00 no bid $44.00 no bid no bid
3 $50.00 no bid $65.00 no bid no bid
4 $11.00 ea no bid $20.00 ea no bid no bid
5 $44.00 no bid  $45.00 & band $8.00 no bid no bid
6 $10.00 $9.00 $15.00 no bid no bid
7 $10.00 no bid $12.00 no bid no bid
8 $4.00 $5.00 $6.00 no bid no bid
9 $4.00 $5.00 $6.00 no bid no bid
10 $4.00 no bid $6.00 no bid no bid
11 $29.00 no bid $85.00 no bid no bid
12 $325.00 no bid $425.00 Taylor Heather no bid no bid
13 $190.00 & screen $8.00 no bid $155.00 Blauer #733 no bid no bid
14 $8.00 no bid $10.00 no bid no bid
15 $108.00 no bid  $100.00 Blauer #6045 no bid no bid
16 $23.50 no bid $40.00 no bid no bid
17 $23.00 no bid $40.00 no bid no bid
18 $2.00 no bid $4.00 no bid no bid
19 $285.00 no bid $300.00 no bid no bid
$541.87 Pacal
PerfxRTH2+D level Il
with Thorsheild
upgrade & an extra
20 $550.00 no bid $740.00 no bid carrier
21 $75.00 no bid no bid no bid $74.80
22 $58.95 $23.00 $70.00 Blauer 343P no bid no bid
23 $46.50 no bid $40.00 no bid no bid
24 $38.50 no bid $40.00 no bid no bid




25 $18.00 $24.00 $40.00 no bid no bid
26 $18.00 $24.00 $40.00 no bid no bid
27 $8.00 $2.50 $8.00 no bid no bid
28 $280.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
29 $168.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
30 $76.00 no bid $95.00 no bid no bid
31 $68.00 no bid $70.00 $34.57 no bid
32 $7.00 no bid $8.00 $1.59 N/$3.30 B no bid
33 $71.00 no bid $70.00 $37.78 no bid
34 $7.00 no bid $8.00 $1.59 N/$3.30 B no bid
35 $72.00 no bid $70.00 $33.88 no bid
36 $25.00 no bid $30.00 $23.98 Don Hume no bid
37 $19.00 no bid $25.00 $16.24 Don Hume no bid
38 $20.50 no bid $30.00 $16.70 no bid
39 $72.00 no bid $60.00 $26.31 no bid
40 $91.00 no bid $110.00 $62.13 no bid
41 $106.00 no bid $110.00 $62.13 no bid
42 $37.00 $26.00 $42.00 $22.35 no bid
43 $40.50 no bid $40.00 $27.21 no bid
44 $9.00 no bid $13.00 $7.29 Don Hume no bid
45 $2.50 $20.00 $6.00 $3.96 no bid
46 $5.00 $16.00 $8.00 $5.23 Don Hume no bid
47 $33.00 no bid $26.00 $18.72 Don Hume no bid
48 $25.00 no bid $30.00 $27.30 Don Hume no bid
49 $5.50 $9.00 $15.00 set $5.16 Don Hume no bid
50 $10.00 $12.00 $12.00 $7.22 no bid
51 $42.00 no bid $55.00 $34.68 Blackinton no bid
52 $44.00 no bid 60 $39.08 Blackinton no bid
53 $44.00 no bid $60.00 $39.09 Blackinton no bid
54 $36.00 no bid $55.00 $34.68 Blackinton no bid
55 $44.00 no bid $55.00 $39.08 Blackinton no bid
56 $8.50 $6.50 $15.00 $7.75 Blackinton no bid
57 $15.50 $15.00 $16.00 $7.91 Blackinton pair no bid
58 $9.95 $6.00 $5.00 | $11.71 Blackinton pair no bid
59 $8.00 $6.00 $5.00 | $11.71 Blackinton pair no bid
60 $9.00 $6.00 $5.00 | $11.71 Blackinton pair no bid
61 $10.50 (4) & $9.50 (3) no bid $25.00 $12.92 (4) $12.04 (3) no bid




62 $14.00 no bid $25.00 $13.85 no bid
$2.50 ea w/ min. 10 per
63 $2.00 no bid style no bid no bid
64 $1.00 no bid $14.00-$20.00 no bid no bid
65 $0.95 no bid $1.00 $12.31 Blackinton no bid
66 $0.95 no bid $1.00 $12.31 Blackinton no bid
67 $1.25 no bid $2.00 $12.31 Blackinton no bid
68 $1.25 no bid $2.00 $12.31 Blackinton no bid
69 $1.00 no bid $2.00 no bid no bid
70 $11.75 no bid 5 See below no bid
71 $120.00 $105.00 no bid $93.82 no bid
72 $139.00 $90.00 no bid $56.47 Premier Crown no bid
73 $100.00 $99.00 $130.00 $83.25 no bid
74 $23.00 $18.00 $35.00 $20.06 no bid
75 $90.00 $80.00 $140.00 $75.30 no bid
76 $16.50 $19.00 $30.00 $15.66 Don Hume no bid
77 $11.00 $11.50 $16.00 no bid no bid
78 $117.00 no bid 110 no bid no bid
79 $26.00 no bid $30.00 no bid no bid
80 $35.00 $32.00 $40.00 $33.40 no bid
81 $36.00 $32.00 $50.00 no bid no bid
82 $79.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
83 $19.00 no bid $30.00 $20.81 no bid
84 $23.50 no bid $25.00 $23.80 no bid
85 $8.00 no bid $7.00 no bid no bid
86 $8.00 no bid $7.00 no bid no bid
87 $15.00 no bid $15.00 no bid no bid
88 $3.00 no bid $5.00 set no bid no bid
89 $3.00 no bid $5.00 set no bid no bid
20 $1.00 no bid $2.00 no bid no bid
91 $1.00 no bid $2.00 no bid no bid
92 $10.50 no bid $25.00 no bid no bid
93 $20.50 no bid $25.00 no bid no bid
94 $20.50 no bid $25.00 no bid no bid
95 $23.50 (4) & $22.50 (3) no bid $25.00 no bid no bid
96 $2.00 no bid $2.50 ea no bid no bid
97 no bid $26.00 $65.00 Blauer no bid no bid




98 $49.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
99 $65.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
100 $36.50 no bid $50.00 $18.41 no bid
101 $7.50 no bid $8.00 ea $7.91 pair no bid
102 $178.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
103 $135.00 no bid $150.00 no bid no bid
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