

City of Rochester

Plow & Wing Blades & Parts-Bid # 10-10

9/3/09

Item #	Description	Granite Industrial Gases	Winter Equipment	H.P. Fairfield	Jordan Equipment	Atlantic Broom
1	Kenna Metal Carbide 12" Hwy Punch 6"x 3/4"	\$47.00	\$42.74	\$52.00	\$48.00	\$48.00
2	Cutting edge 926 loader 47"X10"X1"	\$334.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$258.04
3	Volvo grader-moldboard 84"X8"X5/8"	\$108.50	NO BID	\$117.50	\$93.28	\$110.67
4	9' Fisher plow blade 108"X6"X5/8"	\$101.50	NO BID	\$114.00	\$98.10	\$103.68
5	8' Fisher plow blade 96"X6"X5/8"	\$90.50	NO BID	\$102.00	\$87.20	\$92.16
6	Daewoo loader cutting Edge 25 3/4"X16"1 1/4"	\$367.66	NO BID	\$1,450.00	NO BID	NO BID
7	Plow cover blade 12"hwypunch 120"X6"X5/8"	\$113.16	NO BID	\$120.00	\$109.00	\$115.20
8	Plow cover blade 12"hwypunch 132"X6"X5/8"	\$124.50	NO BID	\$132.00	\$119.90	\$126.72
9	Grader plow cover blade 12" hwypunch 144"X7"X 5/8"	\$136.00	NO BID	\$160.00	\$175.68	\$130.00
10	Trackless Snow blower cutting edge 50"X6"X1/2"	\$37.38	NO BID	\$54.00	\$80.00	\$45.09
11	Bob cat cutting edge 60"X6"X1/2"	\$54.45	NO BID	\$195.00	\$83.85	\$45.09
12	Bombardier cutting edge 60"X6"X5/8"	\$56.42	NO BID	\$69.00	\$178.97	\$57.60

13	Trackless plow blade 60"X6"X5/8"	\$56.42	NO BID	\$54.00	\$178.97	\$57.60
14	Snow blower cutting edge 96"X8"X5/8"	\$122.40	NO BID	\$140.00	\$117.12	\$122.40
15	938H Cat Loader-1"x12"x46 1/2" 1" bolt hole Middle Section (2 each), 1"x6"12 1/2" 1" bolt hole end piece (2 each)	\$903.60	NO BID	\$525.00	\$264.55	\$618.30
16	1420 E Cat Backhoe 3/4"x8"x47" 5/8" bolt hole (2 each)	\$187.50	NO BID	\$263.00	\$94.84	\$369.60
17	Bobcat 3/4"x8"x60" 1/2" Bolt hole	\$115.20	NO BID	NO BID	\$190.00	\$231.00
18	Volvo snow bucket 3/4"x8"x78" 5/8" Bolt hole	\$149.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$102.48	\$323.40