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Bid 10-51 Neptune's

360 Washington St.  
Haverhill, MA  01832     
800-456-1234

ARTICLE ARTICLE DESCRIPTION

1 LS navy blue or white shirt with NH seal buttons included

$34.00 see #89 for 
hashmarks and #64 & 65 

for buttons.

2 SS navy blue or white shirt with NH seal buttons included $31.00 
3 Navy pants with royal blue braid $50.00 
4 Long underwear top and bottom $12.00 ea

5
Uniform hat, round, button down with strap & silver or gold 
cloth band.  Summer & Winter price. $44.00 chin strap $8.00

6 Black baseball hat with gold "POLICE" embroidered $10.00 
7 Black knit winter cap with gold "POLICE" embroidered $4.00 
8 Black standard size clip on tie $4.00 
9 Black short clip on tie $4.00 

10 Royal blue standard clip on tie $4.00 

11

Black fleece-lined V-neck sweater, Ployester/wool/acrylic 
blend w/ badge tab, epaulets, name tab, microphone tab.  
Double patched. no bid

12

Black leather winter jacket.  Currently have outdoor outfits 
mod. 1010 w/double patches and blue on black w/white 
outline around blue slanted 1 3/4 hash marks.  Full liner. $325.00 

13

Full-length reversible rain jacket, black, waterproof, 
windproof, high visibility yellow, ANSI certified class II.  
Convertible side pockets w/waterproof zippers on both 
sides.  Water repellent on both sides.  Adjustable cuff 
closures, Sport collar zip to top.  Badge tabs and 
microphone tabs on both sides.  Price should include 
"Rochester Police"  Screen on back in 3D lettering. $195.00 & screen $12.00

14
Rain cover to match above rain jacekt for above button 
down uniform hat. $6.00 

15

Dark Navy Spring/Fall reversible jacket, above waist, ANSI 
Certified Class II w/high visibility yellow, waterproof/ 
windproof/ breathable fabric lining, badge tabs on both 
sides, microphone tab on hi visibillity side, double patched 
with blue on black 1 3/4 inch hash marks

 $108.00 see #90 for 
hashmarks

16 Black winter gloves $23.50 



17 Search gloves currently have Damascus $23.00 
18 White parade gloves $2.00 

19

Dress uniform coat, 4 pocket, navy blue double patched, 
badge tab, royal blue trim on pockets and snap-down 
epaulets.  Gold/Silver N.H. Seal buttons. $285.00 

20
Paca Perfx-RTH2+D level II ballistic vest w/semi-rigid 
trauma plate and extra carrier.  Current issue.

$650.00 HI Lite BII (06) 
Xtra Carrier

21 Replacement cover for vest
$90.00 HI Lite carrier 

w/thorshield

22

Zip front breakaway ANSI traffic safety vest, ANSI certified 
class II high visibility yellow, microphone tabs on both 
sides, breathable mesh background fabric, "POLICE' 
lettering down front left side and across lower back. $37.00 

23

Black BDU top, long sleeve, front chest pockets w/hook & 
loop closures, nylon canvas, currently issue 5.11 Tactical.  
RPD patch over left breast pocket. no bid

24
Black BDU pants, nylon canvas, comfort-fit waistband, 
double knee and seat currently issue 5.11 Tactical no bid

25 Woodland BDU pants $18.00 
26 Woodland BDU shirt $18.00 

27 BDU black  or OD green name tape strips $8.00 
28 Woodland BDU cold weather gortex parka no bid
29 Woodland BDU cold weather Gortex pants no bid

30 Hi gloss black low cut bates shoes $76.00 

31
Sam browne 2 1/4" high gloss duty belt, 4 row stitching, full 
lined with gold or silver hardware $68.00 

32 Silver or brass belt buckle for above duty belt $7.00 

33
Sally browne 2 1/4" high gloss duty belt, 4 row stitching, 
full lined with gold or silver hardware $75.00 

34 Silver or brass belt buckle for above duty belt $7.00 
35 Above belt with velcro belt tips $76.00 

36
1 1/4" Garrison high gloss pants belt with silver or gold 
buckle $25.00 

37
1 1/4"Garrison matte finish pants belt with silver or gold 
buckle $19.00 

38 1 1/4" Garrison belt with matte finish velcro $20.50 

39
Safariland ALS off duty holster for Glock 21 or Glock 30 
.45 cal STX Plain $90.00 

40
Safariland ALS Holster for Glock 21 or Golck 30 .45 cal 
STX high gloss $156.00 

41 Safariland Double Magazine Pouch STX High Gloss $37.00 

42
High gloss double handcuff case for Peerless hinged 
handcuffs with silver or brass snaps $42.50 

43
High gloss double handcuff loop holder silver or brass 
snap $9.00 



44 High gloss single belt keeper with silver or brass hardware $2.50 
45 High gloss double belt keeper with silver or brass snap $5.00 
46 High gloss OC spray carry case $33.00 
47 High gloss shoulder strap with silver or brass hardware $25.00 
48 High gloss D-Ring with silver or brass hardware $5.50 
49 Black belt badge holder for detective use $10.00 

50

Garel G22 Silver Breast badge "ROCHESTER" across 
bottom & "PATROLMAN" across the top.  All letters in 
black.  N.H. State Seal and 'POLICE' w/blue filler. $40.00 

51 Above badge in gold and silver with wallet clip $44.00 

52
Gold breast badge.  Same as above for Chief, Deputy 
Chief, Captain, Lieutenant, Sergeant, and Detective $44.00 

53
Silver hat badge. Garel G83 w/coco. N.H. State seal, 
numbered cut out. $36.00 

54

Gold hat badge. Garel G83 w/coco. N.H. state seal with 
lettered Sergeant, Lieutenant, Captain, Deputy Chief or 
Chief.  $44.00 

55
Gold or silver high polished name tag w/block letters in 
black.  Reeves 800 clutch back. $8.50 

56 Silver collar "RPD" 1/2" price per set. $15.50 

57 Gold Sgt chevrons $9.95 

58 Gold Lt bars $8.00 

59 Gold Cpt bars $9.00 

60 Gold Chief stars (4) or Gold Deputy Chief stars (3) $10.50 

61
Gold or silver tie bar for male or female with state seal and 
"Rochester Police" in black $14.00 

62 9 different cloth ribbons with clutch back $2.00 

63 Ribbon holders for 1 through 9 ribbons no bid
64 Small NH seal silver button $0.95 ea
65 Small NH seal gold button $0.95 ea
66 Large NH seal silver button $1.25 ea
67 Large NH seal gold button $1.25 ea
68 Silver or gold NH seal hat buttons $1.00 ea

69
Subdued Chief 4 stars, Deputy Chief 3 stars, Cpt & Lt 
bars, collared Sgt Chevrons $11.75 pair



70 Riot helmet w/full shield Crown Premier style #9005 $120.00 
71 Riot shield.  Clear w/police across front.  Pro-Guard. no bid
72 Rechargeable Mag-lite flashlight $100.00 
73 3 D-cell flashligh $23.00 
74 Streamlight Stinger flashlight w/charger AC75001 $90.00 
75 High gloss open top stinger holder for duty belt $16.50 
76 Sabre Red 10% O.C. Spray 1.8 ounce canister $11.00 

77 Auto-lock 22" Monadnock Expandable baton w/ power tip $117.00 
78 Monadnock Espandable Baton holder for duty belt $30.00 
79 Peerless hinged silver handcuffs $35.00 

80 Black street pro gear duty bag no bid
81 300 ft fiberglass tape measure no bid

82

Metal ticket tin, heavy-duty aluminum, clip w/swivel license 
holder, velcro wrap-around strap, top opening, 11 1/2" H x 
6 1/2" W x 2 1/4" D, silver $19.00 

83 Metal report tin $23.50 
84 Silver cloth hat band $8.00 
85 Gold cloth hat band $8.00 

86 White shoulder braid for dress uniform $15.00 
87 Sgt chevron embroiderred patch gold on black $3.00 

88
Sgt chevron patch blue on black with white outline around 
blue $3.00 

89 Gold on black 1 3/4" hash mark $1.00 
90 Blue on black 1 3/4" hash mark $1.00 

91 Sgt shoulder boards $10.50 
92 Lt. Shoulder boards $20.50 
93 Cpt shoulder boards $20.50 
94 Chief 4 stars or Deputy Chief 3 stars shoulder boards $23.50 
95 Rochester Police shoulder patch 500 count $2.00 

96 Black four pocket coaches shorts for bike patrol no bid
97 Bike Safety helmet black w/ 'POLICE" on sides $49.00 
98 Spandex bike shorts w/seat pad black $65.00 

99 Flat black leather handcuff mag pouch for Detectives $36.50 

100 Silver "FTO" collar pin $7.50 

101 MVP 2003 Professional Police Helmets Motorcycle helmet $178.00 

102
Motorcycle breeches/polyester (current brand-Personal 
Taylor) $135.00 



NIFORM & EQUIPMENT BIDS

Gall's Lawmen's Helmet Pro
Worcester County 
Police Equipment

2680 Palumbo Drive  
Lexington KY  40509  800-
876-4242

7750 9th Street SW  Vero 
Beach, FL  32968                     
772-569-8700

1010 Washington St, 
Montpeiler, ID  83254   
208-847-2541

405 Water Street 
Fitchburg, MA  
01420                        
978-343-0019 

no bid no bid no bid $43.00 

no bid no bid no bid $39.00 
no bid no bid no bid $57.00 
no bid no bid no bid $12.00 

no bid no bid no bid $44.95 
$10.00 HW244 no bid no bid $10.00 
$10.00 HW301 no bid no bid $10.00 

$3.50 UA494 no bid no bid $4.00 
$3.50 UA494 sht no bid no bid $4.00 

no bid no bid no bid $4.00 

$32.00 SW665 no bid no bid $83.00 

no bid no bid no bid $298.00 

$85.00 RW121 no bid no bid $139.00 

$7.00 RW038D no bid no bid $10.00 

$86.00 JA007 no bid no bid $125.00 

no bid no bid no bid
$26.00 Finger 
Fashion 7318



no bid no bid no bid
$34.00 Finger 
Fashion 3104

no bid no bid no bid $3.00 

no bid no bid no bid $275.00 

$580.00 ZA3722 no bid no bid $510.00 

$75.00 no bid no bid $105.00 

$25.00 HS334
$15.40 M-XL       $15.95 2XL - 

4XL no bid $65.00 

$36.00 SH801 no bid no bid $39.00 

$34.00 TR336 no bid no bid $41.00 
$40.00 TR425 no bid no bid $35.00 

$34.00 SH1062 no bid no bid $35.00 

$2.00 UA025 no bid no bid $4.25 min order of 3
no bid no bid no bid $325.00 
no bid no bid no bid $275.00 

$52.00 SP863 no bid no bid $87.00 

$45.00 LP073 $35.53 Don Hume B101-A no bid $65.50 
no bid $1.62 no bid $8.00 

no bid $38.50 Don Hume B101-A-L no bid $65.50 
no bid $1.62 no bid $8.00 
no bid $36.30 Don Hume B120 no bid $77.00 

$22.00 LP400 $24.04 Don Hume B109-L no bid $28.00 (1.75 inches) 

no bid $17.44 Don Hume B109 no bid $24.00 (1.75 inches)

no bid $16.45 Don Hume B125 no bid $36.00 (1.75 inches)

no bid no bid no bid $107.00 

no bid no bid no bid $107.00 
no bid no bid no bid $35.00 

$16.00 LP108 $27.23 Don Hume C304-D no bid $34.00 

$8.00 LP099 $7.51 (C308) Don Hume no bid $10.00 



$12.00 LP093 $2.97 Don Hume S502-1 no bid $3.00 
$14.00 LP467 $5.55 Don Hume S502-4 no bid $5.00 
$17.00 LP058 $17.93 Don Hume C309-3-F no bid $35.00 A56502
$38.00 LP604 $24.04 Don Hume S110 no bid $25.50 

$8.50 LP087 $5.21 Don Hume S507 no bid $7.00 each
no bid $5.60 Don Hume C312 no bid $11.00 

$45.00 S220 $37.43 VH Blackinton B587 no bid $46.00 

$45.00 S220 $41.83 VH Blackinton B587 no bid
$46.00 silver/$48.00 
gold

$45.00 S220 $41.83 VH Blackinton B587 no bid $48.00 

$40.00 M407 $37.43 VH Blackinton B617A no bid $43.00 

$44.00 $41.83 VH Blackinton B617A no bid $45.00 

$5.00 NT033 $8.02 VH Blackinton J1 no bid $8.00 

$12.00 CB175 $8.19 pr VH Blackinton A7330 no bid $8.00 Per piece

$6.00 CB043  CB040
$5.23 pr VH Blackinton J59 

sm/J60 large no bid $8.00 

$6.00 CB044  CB050
$5.23 pr VH Blackinton J61 

sm/J62 large no bid $8.00 

$6.00 CB046  CB052
$5.23 pr VH Blackinton J63 

sm/ J64 large no bid $8.00 

no bid

$10.84 pr VH Blackinton 3-star 
#J102 and $13.71pr  4-star 

#J104 no bid $11.55 

no bid $13.85 VH Blackinton A367 no bid $16.00 

no bid no bid no bid

$2.00 min order of 
12 to avoid S&H 
charge

no bid no bid no bid

$3.00 Only 1-3 
ribbons min order of 
12 to avoid S&H 
charges

no bid $12.31 VH Blackinton CE-3 no bid $1.00 
no bid $12.31 VH Blackinton CE-3 no bid $1.00 
no bid $12.31 VH Blackinton CE-3 no bid $1.25 
no bid $12.31 VH Blackinton CE-3 no bid $1.25 
no bid no bid no bid $1.25 

no bid

$10.72 pr VH Blackinton Sgt. 
A8765 and $11.54 Capt. 

A1140 and $10.72 Lt. A1141 
and $14.18 3-star A4887-3 

and 4 star A4887-4 no bid $8.00 



$96.00 TE133 no bid $88.45  Swat 201 PC $130.00 
$80.00 TE076 no bid $62.89 $156.00 
$82.00 FL070 $88.26 RX1019 no bid No bid
$17.00 FL069 $21.75 Mag-lite S3D016 no bid $24.00 

$72.00 FL125AC no bid no bid $96.25 
$17.00 LP062 $16.45 Don Hume D1110T no bid $17.95 
$11.00 SD147 no bid no bid $13.00 

no bid no bid no bid $110.00 
no bid $15.95 Don Hume C121 no bid $27.00 

$34.00 RS005 $33.94 no bid $35.00 

$49.00 BG185 no bid no bid $40.00 
no bid no bid no bid $35.00 

$22.00 CP003 no bid no bid More Info
no bid no bid no bid $27.00 
no bid no bid no bid $7.00 
no bid no bid no bid $7.00 

no bid no bid no bid
$22.00 single white 
cobra knot or tip

no bid no bid no bid $4.00 

no bid no bid no bid $4.00 
no bid no bid no bid $1.50 
no bid no bid no bid $1.50 

no bid no bid no bid
$14.00 all boards 
soft

no bid no bid no bid $14.00 
no bid no bid no bid $14.00 
no bid no bid no bid $14.00 
no bid no bid no bid $2.10 

$33.00 TR598 no bid no bid $66.00 
no bid no bid no bid No bid

$34.00 no bid no bid $70.00 

no bid
$17.60 Don Hume D425-A 

M/C no bid $46.00 

$12.00 CB175 $8.19 pr VH Blackinton A7509 no bid $8.00 each

no bid no bid $134.05 No bid

no bid no bid no bid No bid



East Coast 
Emergency 
Outfitter
1 Industrial 
Park Drive #20 
Pelham NH  
03076           866-
639-0279

No bid

No bid
No bid
$15.95 each

$52.95 
$8.95 

$12.95 
$5.95 
$5.95 
$5.95 

No bid

$199.00 Patrol 
48027 5.11 4-1

No bid

No bid

$99.95  48037   
5.11 Reversible

$29.95 
Blackhawk 8154



$45.95 
Blackhawk 8152

$5.00 

No bid

No bid

No bid

$49.95  300 PSV

$39.95 

$37.95 
$37.95  5.11
$38.95  5.11

$8.00 
No bid
No bid
$74.95  5.11 
ATAC6

$70.00 
$7.00 

$70.00 
$7.00 

$70.00 

$30.00 

$30.00 

$30.00 

No bid

No bid
No bid

$40.00 

$13.00 



$6.00 
$8.00 

$29.00 
$30.00 
$15.00 
$12.00 

$52.95 

$59.95 

$59.95 

$52.95 

$52.95 

$10.00 

$15.95 

$10.00 pr

$10.00 pr

$10.00 pr

$20.00 

$25.00 

$2.50 ea

No bid
$1.50 
$1.50 
$2.00 
$2.00 
$2.00 

$5.00 



No bid
No bid

$125.95 
$29.95 

$139.95 
$29.95 
$14.95 

$122.95 
$32.95 
$39.95 

$35.95  5.11 
patrol bag

$82.95 

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No bid
$5.00 set

$5.00 set
$2.00 
$2.00 

$22.95 
$22.95 
$22.95 
$22.95 

$1.95 ea
$32.95  5.11 
Tactical
No bid
No bid

No bid

$8.00 ea

No bid

No bid


