
City of Rochester

Bulk Oil and Lubricants Bid # 11-02

July 1, 2010 2:45 PM

RECOMMENDED SHELL PRODUCT Windward Petroleum
SHELL ROTELLA T 15W/40 $6.97
SHELL ROTELLA T 30 $380.84
SHELL ROTELLA T 10 $575.12
SHELL DONAX TG $5.81
SHELL DONAX TD $344.70
SHELL SHELLZONE $283.51
PEAK GLOBAL LIFETIME $311.42
SHELL SPIRAX 80/90 $141.23
SHELL RETINAX LC $240.58
SHELL RETINAX LC $62.43
MS AW ISO 46 $5.20
SUNOCO TWO CYCLE $40.88
UNIGARD 15W30 $34.45
OIL-DRI ABSORBENT $6.94
UNI-GUARD $44.37
CLCLO BRAKE & PARTS CLEANER $24.51
CYCLO HEAVY DUTY BREAKE AWAY $29.03
CYCLO STARTING FLUID $20.25
WINSHIELD WASHER FLUID $75.89
MULTIFAK EPO GREASE $87.37
SPIRZ GL 80W-140 $168.03



RANDO HD 46 $27.85
SHELL MORLINA 100 $56.25
MEROPA 680 80W-90 $76.56
MOBIL DHV 632 $184.18
SHELL OMALA RL 460 $162.31
MOBIL DTE OIL HEAVY SYNTHETIC $59.43
MORLINA 220 $624.77
SHELL OMALA 220 $640.96
UNIPAC BLOWER OIL $518.19
MOBIL 5W-30 SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL $39.06
MOBIL DTE 26 #MO11128 $49.93
SAE 30W NON-DETERENT $20.22
HO-1 HYDRAULIC OIL $70.33
URSA 15W-40 $45.06
URSA ED SAE 10W $5.74
STARPLEX 2 GREASE (RED) $21.45
POLYSTAR RB 2 GREASE (PURPLE) $36.65
CHEVRON SRI GREASE NLGI2 (GREEN) $32.76
SHELL ALVANIA NO. 1 GREASE $80.93
PENETRATING OIL $31.20
PENTRATING GREASE (BIG RED) $33.87
CHAIN DRIVE LUBRICAN $88.42
TEXACO CRATER 2X $107.18
ELECTRIC MOTOR CONTACT CLEANER $35.11
DIESEL FUEL ANTI-GEL CNDITIONER $57.30
CASTROL SUPER CLEAN $42.75
ICE-O-DRY WATER REMOVER $26.70



TELLUS T 15 (TROJAN) $61.62
ANCOOL 3760 GLYCOL (TROJAN) No Bid
STABIL CONCENTRATED FUEL STABILIZER $62.80
RANDO HD 68 GEAR OIL $43.12
VIPER LUBE (LOCTIT SYNTHETIC GREASE No Bid
AERO-KROIL No Bid
TEXACO MOLYTEC EP2 $2.50
CHEVRON SRI2 $3.27
NEVASTANE AW46 $70.33
MOBIL FM222 $5.03
NEVASTANE AW 46 No Bid

$6,313.36
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$6,256.46


