
City of Rochester

Plow & Wing Blades & Parts-Bid # 11-10

9/9/10

Item # Description H.P. Fairfield Winter Equipment Atlantic Broom
1 Kenna Metal Carbide 12” Hwy Punch 6”x ¾” $47.50

$47.00 $47.00
2 Cutting edge 926 loader 47”X10”X1” NO BID

NO BID $258.04
3 Volvo grader-moldboard 84”X8”X5/8” $110.00

NO BID $110.67
4 9’ Fisher plow blade     108”X6”X5/8” $100.00

NO BID $103.68
5 8’ Fisher plow blade       96”X6”X5/8” $100.00

NO BID $92.16
6 Daewoo loader cutting Edge25 ¾”X16”1 ¼” $1,400.00

NO BID NO BID
7 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 120”X6”X5/8” $110.00

NO BID $115.20
8 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 132”X6”X5/8” $120.00

NO BID $126.72
Grader plow cover blade

NO BID $130.00
9 12” hwy punch 84”x 8”x 5/8”

NO BID

NO BID $45.09
10 NO BID
11 Bombardier cutting edge 60”X6”X5/8” $65.00

NO BID $57.60

$150.00

Trackless Snow blower cutting edge 
50”X6”X1/2”

$50.00



12 Trackless plow blade  60”X6”X5/8” $55.00
NO BID $57.60

13 Snow blower cutting edge 96”X8”X5/8” $130.00
NO BID $122.40

14 938H Cat Loader-1”x12”x46 ½”  1” bolt hole 
Middle Section (2 each), 1”x6”12 ½” 1” bolt 
hole end piece (2 each)

$600.00
NO BID $618.30

15 1420 E Cat Backhoe ¾”x8”x47” 5/8” bolt hole 
(2 each)

$280.00
NO BID $369.30

16 Bobcat ¾”x8”x60” ½” Bolt hole NO BID
NO BID $231.00

17 Volvo snow bucket  ¾”8”78” 5/8” Bolt hole NO BID
NO BID $323.40

18 ½” x 2” Plow bolts $1.45
NO BID $0.85

19 ½” x 2 ½” Flat head blade bolt $1.45
NO BID $0.90

20 5/8” x 2 ½” Plow bolt
$1.45 $0.82 $1.50

21 5/8” x 3” Plow bolt
$1.45 $0.72 $1.65

22 5/8” x 3 ½” Plow bolt
$1.45 $1.08 $1.75

23 5/8” x 4” Plow bolt
$1.45 $0.96 $1.85

24 5/8” x 4 ½” Plow Bolt
$1.45 $1.06 $1.95

25 5’8” x 2” Flat head blade bolt
$1.45 NO BID $1.25



Valk Manufacturing

$39.40

$136.00

$81.00

$85.00

$76.00

$220.00

$94.00

$104.00

$68.00

$50.00

$67.00



$62.00

$103.00

$240.00

$80.00

$100.00

$140.00

$0.60

$0.65

$0.85

$1.50

$1.75

$2.50

$2.75

$1.00


