City of Rochester

Stone, Gravel & Washed Sand

Bid # 11-29

May 19, 2011 2:45 PM

Iltem Brox Pike Evans Brothers
3/4" Stone base fine $7.75 $7.75 No Bid

1 1/2" Stone base $7.75 $7.75 No Bid

3/8" Stone $12.00 $15.00 No Bid

3/4" Stone $11.75 $11.00 No Bid

1 1/2" Stone $11.00 $11.00 No Bid

Rip Rap

4-6" Stone $11.50 $12.50 No Bid
6-12" Stone $11.50 $12.50 No Bid
Washed Sand-winter roads $9.00 $7.95 $6.00/Yard
Stone Dust $9.50 $6.75 No Bid
Delivery Charge $70.00 $3.50/Ton $84.00 $6.25/ Yard
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