City of Rochester, NH

Equipment Rental and Emergency Construction Services-Bid # 12-19

February 23, 2012 2:45 PM
Louis Rumore SUR
Emergency
Emergency Mobiization
Item Rate/hour |Mobilization CosfiRate/hour |Mobiization Rate |Rate/hour |Mobilization|{Rate/hour [Rate
Large Excavator-Track |No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid $168.00 $520.00] $168.00 $620.00
Medium Excavator-Track |No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid $126.00 $500.00] $126.00 $600.00
Excavator w/hoe-ram $250.00 |$400.00 $500.00 |$400.00 $220.00 $520.00] $220.00 $620.00
Excavator-Rubber Tires [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $126.00 $280.00] $126.00 $480.00
Large Pay Loader No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.00 $280.00] $140.00 $480.00
Medium Pay Loader No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $118.00 $280.00] $118.00 $380.00
Backhoe No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 $200.00] $100.00 $300.00
Tri-axle Dump Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $40.00 $80.00 $40.00
10-Wheel Dump Truck  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $38.00 $75.00 $38.00
6-Wheel Dump Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.50 $35.00 $72.50 $35.00
1-Ton Dump body Truck |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $30.00 $60.00 $30.00
Grader No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00 $135.00] $135.00 $135.00
Vibratory Soil Compactors|No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 $400.00 $90.00 $400.00
Small Bulldozer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.00 $400.00] $110.00 $400.00
Medium Bulldozer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.00 $400.00] $110.00 $400.00
Road Reclamer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00| $1,200.00f $500.00 $1,200.00
Trench Box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 $150.00] $100.00 $150.00
General Labor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.00 $36.00
Utility Pipe Layer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.00 $38.00
Crew Supervision/Layout |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $80.00
Labor Foreman No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $78.00 $78.00
Utiltiy Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 $0.00 $12.00 $0.00
Power Broom No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.00 $105.00] $105.00 $105.00
Water Truck No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 $45.00 $90.00 $45.00
Traffic Control Signage [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 $300.00] $100.00 $300.00
Variable Message Board |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00
Variable Message Board |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00 $50.00f $200.00 $50.00
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