Police Uniform and Equipment Bid 12-40

5/29/2012 14:54
Alternate Choice Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Neptune's Uniforms & Equipment |East Coast Emergency Oultfitters Lawmen's & Shooter's Supply, Inc. Gall's Ben's Uniforms, Inc.
360 Washington Street 581 Second Street 7750 9th Street SW 1340 Russell Cave Road |20 Main Street
Haverhill MA 01832 Manchester NH 03103 Vero Beach, FL 32968 Lexington KY 40505 Amesbury MA 01913
Attn: Steve 866-639-0279 772-569-8700 Attn: Joe Clement 800-255-2367
800-456-1234 800-876-4242 Ext. 2242
Package #1
Item
1% 34.00 | $ 45.00 No Bid No Bid $ 40.00
23 31.00 | $ 43.00 No Bid No Bid $ 35.00
3 % 55.00 | $ 59.00 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00
4 3 45.00 | $ 52.95 No Bid No Bid $ 45.00
5% 8.00 $ 8.95 No Bid $ 8.00 $ 12.00
5% - $ - No Bid $ 2.00 $ -
6 $ 10.00  $ 29.00 No Bid No Bid $ 15.00
7% 4.00  $ 5.50 No Bid $ 375 | $ 6.00
8 $ 4.00  $ 5.50 No Bid $ 375 | $ 63.00
9% 37.00 | $ 85.00 No Bid No Bid $ 90.00
10 $ 400.00 | $ 315.00 No Bid No Bid $ 245.00
11 No Bid $ 125.00 No Bid No Bid $ 145.00
12/ No Bid $ 10.00 No Bid No Bid $ 8.00
13 $ 114.00 | $ 99.95 No Bid No Bid $ 100.00
14 $ 27.00 | $ 22.95 No Bid No Bid $ 45.00
15 $ 23.00 | $ 21.95 No Bid No Bid $ 38.00
16 $ 37.00 | $ 3995  $ 25.40 | No Bid $ 60.00
16 $ - $ - $ 25.95 | No Bid $ 49.99
17 $ 27.00 | $ 38.95 No Bid $ 39.00 | $ 49.99
18 $ 27.00 | $ 37.95 No Bid $ 37.00 | $ 100.00
19 % 82.00 | $ 54.00 4097 $ 75.00
Total $ 965.00 $ 1,099.60 | $ 66.37 | $ - $ 1,147.98
Package #2
Item
20 $ 65.00 | $ 63.00  $ 47.30 No Bid $ 70.00
21 $ 8.00 $ 10.00  $ 4.57 No Bid $ 8.00
22 $ 65.00 | $ 65.00  $ 50.60 No Bid $ 70.00
23 $ 8.00 $ 10.00  $ 4.57 No Bid $ 8.00
23 $ 67.00 | $ 75.00  $ - No Bid $ 70.00
24 $ 25.00 | $ 28.00 $ 14.96 No Bid $ 30.00
25 $ 19.00  $ 24.00  $ 12.65 No Bid $ 25.00
26 $ 21.00 | $ 27.00  $ 16.06 No Bid $ 30.00
27 $ 65.50 | $ 79.00  No Bid No Bid $ 45.00
28 $ 165.00 | $ 109.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 160.00




29 $ 37.00 | $ 39.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 45.00
30 $ 4250 | $ 39.00 | $ 29.65 No Bid $ 42.00
3113 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 8.53 |No Bid $ 12.00
32 $ 250 $ 4.00 $ 286 | $ 9.50 | $ 5.00
33 % 5.00 | $ 6.00  $ 517 | $ 13.00 | $ 7.00
34 3 33.00 | $ 31.00 | $ 18.15 | $ 17.00 | $ 28.00
35 3 10.00 | $ 11.95 | $ 7.65 No Bid $ 12.00
36 $ 40.00 $ 4195 | $ 3789 | $ 36.00 | $ 55.00
37 $ 40.00  $ 4495 | $ 43.06 | $ 41.00 $ 55.00
37 $ 44.00 $ - $ 36.00 | $ -

38 $ 44.00 ' $ 4495 | $ 43.06 | $ 41.00  $ 55.00
39 $ 37.00 | $ 3995 | $ 3789 | $ 37.00 | $ 50.00
40 $ 38.00 | $ 4495 | $ 43.06 | $ 41.00  $ 50.00
M1 % 11.00 | $ 895 | $ 749 | $ 6.00 $ 15.00
42 $ 1550 | $ 13.95 | $ 779 | $ 12.00 | $ 16.00
43 3 10.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 5.10 | $ 5.00 | $ 6.00
4 s 9.00 | $ 8.00 $ 510  $ 5.00 | $ 6.00
45 3 11.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 5.10 | $ 5.00 | $ 63.00
46 $ 11.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 13.38 No Bid $ 25.00
46 $ 10.41 | No Bid $ -

47 $ 15.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 1462 | $ 1450 | $ 25.00
48 $ 200 $ 3.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 2.50
49 No Bid $ 4.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 14.00
49 No Bid $ - No Bid No Bid $ 20.00
50 $ 1.00 $ 1.50 | No Bid No Bid $ 1.00
51 $ 1.00 $ 1.50 | No Bid No Bid $ 1.00
52 $ 125 $ 2.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1.00
53 $ 125 $ 2.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1.00
54 $ 150 $ 2.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1.00
55 $ 12.00  $ 10.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 25.00
56 $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 | No Bid $ 19.50 | $ 35.00
57 $ 110.00 $ 89.00  No Bid $ 79.00 | $ 110.00
58 $ 22.00 | $ 1750 | $ 17.93 | $ 1550 | $ 32.00
59 $ 1450 | $ 12.95 | No Bid $ 10.00 | $ 16.95
60 $ 116.00 $ 119.00 No Bid No Bid $ 105.00
61 $ 24.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 17.49 No Bid $ 35.00
62 $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 3394 | $ 32.00 | $ 40.00
63 $ 37.00 | $ 38.00  No Bid $ 30.00 | $ 50.00
64 $ 18.50 | $ 27.00 | No Bid $ 15.00 | $ 32.00
65 $ 24.00 | $ 27.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 35.00
66 $ 8.00 | $ 9.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 7.00
67 $ 8.00 $ 9.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 7.00
68 $ 200 $ 3.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 5.00
69 $ 200 $ 3.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 5.00
70 $ 1.00 $ 2.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 2.00
13 1.00 $ 2.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 2.00
72 $ 200 $ 1.95 | No Bid No Bid $ 2.50
73 $ 4150  $ 38.95 | No Bid $ 30.00 | $ 50.00
74 $ 10.00 | $ 8.00 $ 749 $ 12.00 | $ 8.00




Totals

1,495.50

1,444.95

466.58

668.50

1,656.95

Grand Total

1,515.50

2,544.55

532.95

668.50

2,804.93




