City of Rochester, NH

Chemical Bid
Bid # 12-47
June 21, 2012 2:00 PM
Item Pencco Chemical Solutions |F2 Industires Pristine  |BHS Harcros [Borden & Remington |Holland |George Coyne Chemical [American International |Shannon |General Chemical [Monson Univar Carus Jones
Aluminum Sulfate - 48% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid 0.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Hydroxide - 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.2053  |0.7892 No Bid  |No Bid No Bid No Bid  |No Bid NoBid [0.7451 [NoBid |0.793
Non Zinc Orthopolysphosphate No Bid No Bid $1.17 1.266 No bid No Bid  |No Bid NoBid |1.322 No Bid 1.207 No Bid NoBid |[NoBid [1.23 No Bid
Sodium Hypochlorite - 15% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid ]0.7435 [0.6971 No Bid  |No Bid No Bid No Bid  |No Bid NoBid |0.6472 [NoBid |0.648
Hydroflousilic Acid - 25% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |3.9724 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.259 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Hydrosulfite Conc.

No Bid $3.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.8385 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Fluoride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |0.87 0.824 No Bid No Bid 0.87 No Bid No Bid 0.798 0.78 No Bid No Bid
*Dense Soda Ash -

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2015 [0.1972 |0.214 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1998 [0.1954 |NoBid No Bid
**Sodium Bicarbonate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.348 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3245 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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