City of Rochester, NH
Nuts, Bolts, and Assorted Hardware

Bid # 12-53

June 21, 2012 2:15 PM
BOLTS GRADE 8
COARSE THREAD |Fastenal |Napa Atlantic Broom
1/4"x 1" $0.0564 [0.12 No Bid
1/4" x 2" $0.1154 ]0.19 No Bid
1/4" x 3" $0.1769 ]0.32 No Bid
5/16" x 1" $0.1074 ]0.19 No Bid
5/16" x 2" $0.1613 ]0.26 No Bid
5/16" x 3" $0.2268 ]0.35 No Bid
3/8"x 2" $0.2160 ]0.35 No Bid
3/8"x 3" $0.3068 |0.47 No Bid
1/2"x 2" $0.3821 ]0.65 1.40
1/2"x 3" $0.5563 ]0.89 1.00
1/2" x 4" $0.7121 ]1.13 2.45
9/16”" x 3" $0.7088 ]1.38 No Bid
9/16” x 4" $0.8984 |1.76 No Bid
5/8" x 3" $0.8703 |1.50 1.88
5/8" x 4" $1.1003 |1.83 2.15
11/16" x 2" NO BID |[NO BID No Bid
11/16" x 4” NO BID |[NO BID No Bid
3/4" x 3" $1.2876 [2.22 2.80
3/4" x 4" $1.7166 [2.62 4.75
BOLTS GRADE 8
FINE THREAD
1/4" x 1" $0.0641 [0.14 No Bid
1/4" x 2" $0.1356  [0.20 No Bid
5/16" x 1" $0.0977 [0.20 No Bid
5/16" x 2" $0.1926 [0.28 No Bid
3/8"x 2" $0.2400 [0.38 No Bid
3/8"x 3" $0.3407 [0.50 No Bid
7/16" x 2" $0.3459 [0.57 No Bid
7/16" x 3" $0.4788 [0.80 No Bid
1/2"x 2" $0.4244 [0.72 No Bid
1/2"x 3" $0.6278 [0.98 No Bid
9/16" x 2" $0.6059 [1.17 No Bid
9/16”" x 3" $0.8430 [1.50 No Bid
5/8" x 2" $0.6696 [1.23 No Bid
5/8" x 3" $0.9684 |1.68 No Bid
3/4" x 3" $1.4657 |2.49 No Bid
3/4" x 4" $1.5887 [2.92 No Bid
3/4" x 5" $1.9662 |3.62 No Bid
3/4" x 6" $2.3751 ]4.20 No Bid
NUTS GRADE 8
COARSE THREAD
1/4" $0.0245 ]0.07 No Bid
5/16" $0.0362 |0.10 No Bid




3/8" $0.0431 ]0.15 No Bid
1/2" $0.1035 ]0.33 0.30
9/16" $0.1959 [0.52 No Bid
5/8" $0.1920 |0.57 0.50
3/4" $0.3117 ]0.89 0.65
NUTS GRADE 8

FINE THREAD

1/4" $0.0276  |0.07 No Bid
5/16" $0.0380 ]0.12 No Bid
3/8" $0.0545 ]0.15 No Bid
7/16" $0.0945 ]0.26 No Bid
1/2" $0.1151 ]0.35 No Bid
9/16" $0.1946 |0.57 No Bid
5/8" $0.2409 |0.63 No Bid
3/4" $0.4023 ]0.96 No Bid
GRADE 8 PLUS

FLAT WASHERS

1/4" $0.0219 [0.05 No Bid
5/16" $0.0231 [0.07 No Bid
3/8" $0.0308 [0.10 No Bid
7/16" $0.0387 [0.14 No Bid
1/2" $0.0786 [0.20 0.10
9/16" $0.1010 [0.28 No Bid
5/8" $0.1410 [0.35 0.20
3/4" $0.1635 [0.42 0.40
GRADE 8 PLUS

LOCK WASHERS

1/4" $0.0137 [0.04 No Bid
5/16" $0.0224 [0.05 No Bid
3/8" $0.0291 [0.07 No Bid
7/16" $0.0519 [0.12 No Bid
1/2" $0.0650 [0.17 0.15
9/16" $0.0903 [0.22 No Bid
5/8" $0.1127 (0.37 0.25
3/4" $0.2136  [0.54 0.35
STAINLESS STEEL

TYPE 316

Y4-20x1/2” $0.1121 [0.14 No Bid
Y4-20x3/4” $0.1353 [0.17 No Bid
Y4-20x1” $0.1578 [0.17 No Bid
Y4-20X1 ¥2" $0.2322  (0.31 No Bid
Y4-20x2” $0.2882 [0.32 No Bid
5/16-18x1/2” $0.2282 [0.22 No Bid
5/16-18x3/4" $0.2238 ]0.26 No Bid
5/16-18-1 $0.2510 ]0.31 No Bid
5/16-18x 1/12” $0.3461 |0.37 No Bid
5/16-18x2" $0.4517 ]0.55 No Bid
3/8-16x2 ¥5" $0.7940 ]0.33 No Bid
7/16-14x3/4” $0.4268 ]0.45 No Bid
7/16-14x1" $0.6407 10.54 No Bid
7/16-14x 1 %" $0.6930 |0.63 No Bid




7/16-14x2" $0.9531 [0.72 No Bid
7/16-14x 2 ¥5" $1.2671 ]0.83 No Bid
%-13x1" $0.7712 ]0.89 No Bid
5-13x 1/1/2” $0.9593 |1.07 No Bid
Y-12x2" $1.1763 [1.26 No Bid
Y-13x 2 Y2 $1.4267 [1.69 No Bid
Y2-13x3" $1.7036  [1.70 No Bid
5/8-11x 2 %" $2.0313  [2.49 No Bid
5/8-11x3 %5" $2.6748 |3.52 No Bid
5/8-11x6" $5.9460 |5.71 No Bid
¥,-10x2 12" $3.2135 [4.20 No Bid
¥-10x 3 12" $4.1309 |5.11 No Bid
3/4-10x6" $7.0136 [8.26 No Bid
7/8-9x4” $6.9552 [NO BID No Bid
7/8-9x6 $10.5896 [NO BID No Bid
STAINLESS STEEL

TYPE 316 FLAT

WASHERS

1/4” $0.0353 |0.09 No Bid
5/16" $0.0620 [0.10 No Bid
3/8” $0.0677 [0.14 No Bid
7/16" $0.1848 [0.20 No Bid
1/2" $0.1782 [0.31 No Bid
5/8” $0.3405 [0.40 No Bid
3/4” $0.6771 [0.70 No Bid
7/8” $0.7073 [NO BID No Bid
STAINLESS STEEL

TYPE 316 LOCK

WASHERS

1/4” $0.0377 [0.05 No Bid
5/16" $0.0617 [0.07 No Bid
3/8” $0.1034 [0.10 No Bid
7/16” $0.1323 [0.26 No Bid
1/2" $0.2013 [0.22 No Bid
5/8” $0.3722  [0.44 No Bid
3/4” $0.6425 [0.73 No Bid
7/8" $0.9839 [NO BID No Bid
STAINLESS STEEL

TYPE 316 NUTS

Ya"-20 $0.0791 (0.10 No Bid
5/16"18 $0.1230 [0.12 No Bid
3/8"-16 $0.1457 ]0.24 No Bid
7/16"-14 $0.2834 ]0.33 No Bid
1/2"-13 $0.3396 |0.38 No Bid
5/8"-11 $0.6732  |0.77 No Bid
3/4"-10 $1.1312 [1.28 No Bid
7/8"-9 $1.6346 |[NO BID No Bid
3/8"-16 NO BID |[NO BID No Bid
7/16"-14 NO BID |[NO BID No Bid
¥2"-13 NO BID |[NO BID No Bid
5/8"-11 NO BID |[NO BID No Bid




¥2"-10

NO BID

NO BID

No Bid

7/8"-9

NO BID

NO BID

No Bid
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