City of Rochester, NH
Chemical Bid # 17-51

June 8, 2017

2:30 PM

Calgon
Borden & Remington [Thatcher Co. | Chemrite [Univar Harcros AIC Monson Shannon |[Oxbow BHS Kemira Carbon Carus Chemtrade [Marubeni [George Coyne|Holland
Aluminum Sulfate-48% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ]0.730 No Bid No Bid 1.134 No Bid No Bid 0.75
Sodium Hydroxide-25% $0.8775 No Bid No Bid 0.8590 0.9619 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Non Zinc
Orthopolysphosphate No Bid No Bid 1.076 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.963 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.08 No Bid No Bid 1.0722 No Bid
0.7639/gal
Sodium Hypochlorite-15% 0.8497 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.07051b  [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Hydrosulfite Conc.
90% 220 Lb drum (Equivalent to No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Fluoride 0.6895 No Bid No Bid 0.8558 0.6825 No Bid 0.745 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dense Soda Ash 0.1748 No Bid No Bid 0.18 0.1765 No Bid 0.1748 No Bid No Bid 0.2045 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.3795
Sodium Bicarbonate-Bulk Form No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3795 No Bid No Bid 0.377 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodium Bicarbonate-50 |b bag form
Equivalent to Natrium Grade #6 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3467 $0.3710 No Bid 0.329 No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powdered Activated Carbon 50 Ib
bags No Bid No Bid 0.789 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.219 No Bid 0.79 No Bid |No Bid 0.8900 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.1601 No Bid
Potassium Permanganate 1.7626 1.69 1.68 No Bid $1.9400 1.71 No Bid 1.63 No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.575 1.7088 No Bid
Farmington Totals
Farmington WWTP-54 Baldwins
Way
Sodium Sulfate-48% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.66
0.9619
Sodium Hydroxide-25 % 1.2908 No Bid No Bid 1.1160 1.0949 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Well 5 NH Route 11
0.9619
Sodium Hydroxide-25 % 0.9783 No Bid No Bid 1.1160 1.0949 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Well 6 211 NH Route 11 No Bid
0.9619
Sodium Hydroxide-25 % 0.9783 No Bid No Bid 1.1160 1.0949 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

* Please note that some of the vendors have to amounts based on quantity ordred




	REsults

