
City of Rochester, NH, Plow Blades & Parts Bid # 18-11

September 21, 2017 2:30 PM

Item # Description HP Field
Winter Equipment Jordan Equipment Atlantic Broom

1 Carbide insert blade 12" hwy. punch 6" x 3/4" with a minimum 3/8" wide x 5/8" 
tall carbide insert

P/foot $50.00
$62.00 $42.39 $44.50

2 Volvo Grader-moldboard 84”X8”X5/8” Each NO BID
NO BID $99.78 $120.00

3 9’ Fisher plow blade 108”X6”X5/8” Each $98.00
$63.48 $73.48 $85.24

4 8’ Fisher plow blade  96”X6”X5/8” Each $92.00
$56.48 $65.28 $75.77

5 Fisher  Extreme 8 ½’ V plow Each $193.00
$603.82 $171.72 $325.00

6 Daewoo Loader cutting edge 25 ¾”X16”1 ¼”  with bolts Each NO BID
NO BID $1,626.18 NO BID

7 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 120”X6”X5/8” Each $100.00
$70.59 $81.60 $94.72

8 Plow cover blade 12”hwy punch 132”X6”X5/8” Each $110.00
$77.65 $89.76 $104.19

9 Grader plow cover blade  12" hwy punch 84"x8"x5/8" Each NO BID
$61.70 $99.78 $88.06

10 Trackless xx75 snow Quip snowblower cutting Edge 51"x4"x5/8" Each $50.00
NO BID $38.20 $64.00

11 Bombardier cutting edge 60”X6”X5/8” Each NO BID
NO BID $40.80 $64.00

12 Trackless plow blade  60”X6”X5/8” Each NO BID
NO BID $40.80 $64.00

13 938H Cat Loader-1”x12”x 46 ½”  1” bolt hole middle Section (2 each), 1”x6”12 
½” 1” bolt hole end piece (2 each)

Total Price for full 
set with bolts

NO BID
NO BID $477.68 NO BID

14 Cat 914K Loader Each NO BID
NO BID $345.30 NO BID

15 1420 E Cat Backhoe ¾”x8”x47” 5/8” bolt hole (2 each) Each NO BID
NO BID $106.78 $184.00

16 Cat 226B3 Skid Steer Each NO BID
NO BID $123.37 NO BID

17 Volvo Snow bucket  ¾”8” 78” 5/8” bolt hole Each NO BID
NO BID $280.00 $300.30

18 ½” x 2” Plow bolts Each $1.00
$0.65 $0.52 $1.50

19 ½” x 2 ½” Flat head blade bolt Each NO BID
$0.77 $0.64 $1.55

20 5/8” x 2 ½” Plow bolt Each $1.58
$0.76 $0.78 $1.65

21 5/8” x 3” Plow bolt Each $1.82
$1.06 $0.85 $1.75



22 5/8” x 3 ½” Plow bolt Each $2.09
$1.04 $0.93 $1.85

23 5/8” x 4” Plow bolt Each $2.22
$1.51 $1.00 $1.95

24 5/8” x 4 ½” Plow Bolt Each $2.27
$1.71 $1.12 $2.05

25 5’8” x 2” Flat head blade bolt Each NO BID
NO BID $0.64 $1.45

26 Curb guard part # UG-478 Each NO BID
$71.78 NO BID $97.75
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