
City of Rochester, NH Plow Blades & Parts Bid # 19-12
August 23, 2018 3:00 PM

ITEM# DESCRIPTION Jordan Equipment Co. Winter Equipment Co., Inc. Atlantic Broom

1 Carbide insert blade 12" p/foot $46.08 $80.61 $62.00

2 Volvo Grader-moldboard each $124.99 $66.37 $124.95

3 9’ Fisher plow blade each $74.80 $65.81 $115.20

4 8’ Fisher plow blade  each $66.48 $58.53 $102.40

5 Fisher  Extreme 8 ½’ V each $173.25 $851.59 $350.00

6 Daewoo Loader cutting Total Price for full set with bolts $1,732.29 no bid $725.00

7 Plow cover blade 12”hwy each $83.11 $73.17 $128.00

8 Plow cover blade 12”hwy each $91.43 $80.48 $140.80

Grader plow cover blade Total Price for full set with bolts $142.88 $117.60 $252.70

12” hwy punch 144”x 8”x 
10 Trackless xx75 snow Quip each $44.88 no bid $58.00

11 Bombardier cutting edge each $46.96 $36.61 $64.00

12 Trackless plow blade  each $54.04 $36.61 $64.00

13 938H Cat Loader-1”x12”x Total Price for full set with bolts $572.78 no bid $916.00

14 Cat 914K Loader each $300.49 no bid no bid

15 420 E Cat Backhoe Total Price for full set with bolts $248.90 no bid $390.40

16 Cat 226B3 Skid Steer each $125.95 no bid no bid

17 Volvo Snow bucket  ¾”8” each $316.40 no bid $323.40

18 ½” x 2” Plow bolts each $0.54 $0.51 $1.50

19 ½” x 2 ½” Flat head blade each $0.66 $0.56 $1.60

20 5/8” x 2 ½” Plow bolt each $0.80 $0.76 $1.85

21 5/8” x 3” Plow bolt each $0.87 $1.51 $1.95

22 5/8” x 3 ½” Plow bolt each $1.00 $1.26 $2.05

23 5/8” x 4” Plow bolt each $1.13 $1.51 $2.15

24 5/8” x 4 ½” Plow Bolt each 1..20 $1.71 $2.25

25 5’8” x 2” Flat head blade each $0.68 $0.64 $1.75

26 Curb guard part # UG-478 each no bid $76.20 $121.00
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