8/4/2016

Bid 19-30 Results

Police Equipment

Vendor Item # Price per unit Quantity Cost in figures
Coyote Creek Outfitters, LLC 1 S 110.00 49| S 5,390.00
22 Farmington Road 2 S 112.00 44| S 4,928.00
Rochester NH 03867 3 S 112.00 6 S 672.00
Phone 603-332-3270 4 S 112.00 12| S 1,344.00
5 S 210.00 9| S 1,890.00
6 S 60.00 9| S 540.00
7 S 38.00 9S 342.00
8 S 270.00 9| S 2,430.00
Total Costs| $ 17,536.00
Vendor Item # Price per unit Quantity Cost in figures
Proforce Law Enforcement 1 S 96.45 49| S 4,726.05
2625 Stearhall Road STEA 2 No Bid 44 No Bid
Prescott, AZ 86301 3 No Bid 6 No Bid
Phone 928-776-7192 4 No Bid 12 No Bid
5 S 206.92 98§ 1,862.28
6 S 60.77 9/ S 546.93
7 No Bid 9 No Bid
8 S 268.46 9§ 2,416.14
Total Costs| $ 9,551.40
Vendor Item # Price per unit Quantity Cost in figures
Witmer Public Safety Group 1 S 109.21 49| S 5,351.29
104 Independence Way 2 No Bid 44| No Bid
Coatesville PA 19320 3 No Bid 6| No Bid
Phone HQ 800-852-6088 or Local 207-590-
5631 4 No Bid 12| No Bid
5 S 229.63 98§ 2,066.67
6 S 67.43 9§ 606.87
7 No Bid 9| No Bid
8 S 297.92 9§ 2,681.28
Total Costs| $ 10,706.11
Vendor Item # Price per unit | Quantity Cost in figures
White Birch Armory 1 S 105.31 49| $ 5,160.19
9 Great Falls Ave. Ste 2 2 No Bid 44




Rochester NH 03867 3 No Bid 6
Phone 603-330-0146 4 No Bid 12
5 S 210.00 9§ 1,890.00
6 No Bid 9
7 No Bid 9
8 S 289.30 9§ 2,603.70
Total Costs| $ 9,653.89
Vendor Item # Price per unit Quantity Cost in figures
Atlantic Tactical, Inc. 1 S 112.45 49| S 5,510.05
763 Corporate Circle 2 S 101.10 44| S 4,448.40
New Cumberland PA 17070 3 S 101.10 6| 606.60
Phone 717-774-3339 ext. 151142 4 S 101.10 12| S 1,213.20
5 S 216.87 9| S 1,951.83
6 S 72.88 9§ 655.92
7 S 48.25 9| S 434.25
8 S 288.90 9§ 2,600.10
Total Costs| $ 17,420.35




