City of Rochester, NH

Bulk Oil & Lubricants Bid # 22-51
June 30, 2022 3:00 PM
Descripton Dennison
SHELL ROTELLA T 15W/40 $12.14
SHELL ROTELLAT 30 $878.50
SHELL ROTELLAT 10 $849.42
SHELL DONAX TG $22.05
SHELL DONAX TG $117.42
SHELL DONAX TD $766.92
SHELL SHELLZONE $399.00
HEAVY DUTY DIESELS SHELL ELC NTIRATE FREE [$587.64
SHELL SPIRAX 80/90 $331.08
SHELL RETINAX LC $507.38
SHELL RETINAX LC $137.30
MS AW ISO 46 $8.79
SUNOCO TWO CYCLE $104.68
UNIGARD 15W30 $36.95
OIL-DRI ABSORBENT $10.45
UNI-GUARD $48.04
DEF $150.00
DEF $2.35
UNI-GUARD $48.04
CLCLO BRAKE & PARTS CLEANER $34.42
CYCLO HEAVY DUTY BREAKE AWAY $33.60
CYCLO STARTING FLUID $40.80
WINSHIELD WASHER FLUID $138.57
RAIN X $335.71
DEXTRON $71.35
SHELL SPIRAX 56atf $2,259.21
PENNWOOD SYN-BLEND 5W-30 $10.70
BRAKE CLEAN $83.27
SAE 75-90 SYNTHETIC HYPOID GEAR OIL $132.42
SAE 75-90 SYNTHETIC HYPOID GEAR OIL $412.34
ABSORBANT PADS $43.57
ABSORBANT PADS no bid
ABORBANT PADS $55.71
ABORBANT PADS no bid
SPIRZ GL 80W-140 $158.57
OMALA 680 80W-90 $167.57
MOBIL SHC 632 $261.42
SHELL OMALA RL 460 $272.07
MOBIL DTE OIL HEAVY SYNTHETIC $150.00
SHELL OMALA 220 $160.50
MORLINA SD 220 $150.00

MOBIL 5W-30 SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL

$62.18




MOBIL DTE 26 #M011128

$59.42

SAE 30W NON-DETERENT KENDALL PRODUCT

$47.62
HYDRAULIC OIL $§75.21
URSA ED SAE 10W $36.95
STARPLEX 2 GREASE (RED) $45.76
CHEVRON SRI GREASE NLGI2 (GREEN) $89.65
SHELL ALVANIA NO. 1 GREASE $175.00
PENETRATING OIL-PB $§77.14
PENTRATING GREASE (BIG RED) $45.76
CHAIN DRIVE LUBRICANT $44.91
TEXACO CRATER 2X $257.14
ELECTRIC MOTOR CONTACT CLEANER $29.48
DIESEL FUEL ANTI-GEL CONDITIONER $68.53
CASTROL SUPER CLEAN $31.42
ICE-O-DRY WATER REMOVER $26.57
TELLUS T 15 (TROJAN) $150.00
ANCOOL 3760 GLYCOL (TROJAN) no bid
STABIL CONCENTRATED FUEL STABILIZER $65.71
AERO-KROIL $77.14
SHELL ALAVANIA EP00 $228.57
SHELL ALAVANIA EP0O n/a
SHELL CORENA PAO ISO- 32 $250.00
FLUIDPRO UNDERCOAT SPRAY no bid
CYCLO CARBURETOR $35.82
TEXACO MOLYTEC EP2 $4.90
LUBRIPLATE FMO-200- AW n/a
LUBRIPLATE FMO-200- AW $192.85
ROYAL PURPLE SYNFILMS RECIP 100 $275.00
MOBIL FM222 $25.00
LUBEMASTER PREMALUBE FG $25.00

NAVASTANE EP 150

$260.00
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